

THE SCHOOL BOARD OF MIAMI-DADE COUNTY
Regular Bid Opening

The following persons were present at the Bid Opening in the Auditorium of the School Board Administration Building at 2:00 p.m., July 27, 1999.

Mrs. Alicia Lafarga, Acting Chairperson
Mr. Arnold Velazquez, Jr., Procurement and Materials Management
Ms. Marilyn Hernandez, Bureau of Facilities Management

CONSTRUCTION BIDS

Project No. A-0601
ADDITIONS, REMODELING AND RENOVATIONS
CORAL TERRACE ELEMENTARY SCHOOL

<u>BIDDER</u>	<u>BOND/CHECK</u>	<u>DEDUCTIVE ALTERNATES</u>	<u>BASEBID</u>
Kalex Const. Miami, FL Addenda # 1 TSA Y	5 % Y	1) 15,650.00 2) 6,500.00	\$1,910,000
Carivon Const. Miami, FL Addenda #1 TSA Y	5 % Y	1) 17,000.00 2) 14,000.00	\$2,142,000
M.A.P. Const. Miami, FL Addenda #1 Y TSA Y	5% Y	1) 17,000.00 2) 9,570.00	\$2,284,480

OFFICIAL RESULTS OF JULY 27, 1999 BID OPENING

Project No. JOC 99 - SOUTH

BIDDER	BOND	ADDENDUM	USA	DESIGN	NORMAL	DESIGN	OVERTIME	NORMAL	DESIGN	OVERTIME	WEIGHTED
H A CONTRACTING	5% BOND	A	Y	0.9500	1.1500	0.8900	1.1400	0.9305			
TRAN CONSTRUCTION	\$20,000.00		Y	1.0394	1.1394	1.0000	1.0894	1.0213			
REGOSA ENGINEERING	\$20,000.00	A	Y	1.0500	1.0700	1.0400	1.0500	1.0445			
F & L CONSTRUCTION	5% BOND		Y	1.2199	1.2999	1.1099	1.1599	1.1494			

CONSTRUCTION BIDS

OFFICIAL RESULTS OF JULY 27, 1999 BID OPENING

Project No. JOC 99 - NORTH CENTRAL

BIDDER	BOND/CHECK	ADDENDA	USA	DESIGN/NORMAL	DESIGN/OVERTIME	NO DESIGN/NORMAL	NO DESIGN/OVERTIME	WEIGHTED BID
RENAISSANCE BUILDERS	5% BOND	A	Y	1.0000	1.2000	0.9500	1.2000	0.9875
MEXAL CORP	5% BOND		Y	1.0444	1.1444	1.0000	1.0944	1.0230
REGOSA ENGINEERING	\$20,000.00	A	Y	1.0200	1.0300	1.0000	1.1000	1.0115

CONSTRUCTION BIDS

PURCHASING BIDS

BID #281-XX02 --UNDERGROUND PETROLEUM STORAGE TANKS: REMOVALS AND CLEAN-UP

Allied Environmental Service, Inc.
Alpha Engineers Corp.
Browning-Ferris Industries (no bid)
Browning-Ferris Industries (letter/no bid)
Engineered Environmental Solutions, Inc.
Environmental Regulatory Compliance, Inc.
Florida Metro Construction Co.
Petroleum Management, Inc.
Waste Management of Dade County (no bid)

BID #292-XX05M/WBE -- CLASSROOM SUPPLIES

AFP Industries, Inc.
Miritech International, Inc.
N & K Enterprises, inc.
Queen Office Supplies, Inc. (letter/no bid)

BID #021-ZZ01M/WBE -- ARMED SECURITY GUARD SERVICE II

AAA & Associates, Inc.
Alanis Security, Inc.
Art Hall Protection Service, Inc.
Dadeline Corporation
Deland Security, Inc.
Diamond Detective Agency
ECO Security, Inc.
Gabriel Security Corp., Inc.
J. V. Security Services, Inc.
Las Top Security, Inc.
Navarro Security
Top Hat Security Services (letter/no bid)

PURCHASING BIDS

BID #022-ZZ02M/WBE -- CAULKING

All Quality Products
Biko Engineering Services, Inc.
Biscayne Electric & Hardware Dist., Inc.
Galloway Office Supply & Equipment
LHP Group, Inc.
Miami Industrial Services
O-GEE Paint Company
Somay Products (no bid)
Tower Paint Manufacturer
W. W. Grainger (letter/no bid)