

THE SCHOOL BOARD OF MIAMI-DADE COUNTY
Regular Bid Opening

The following persons were present at the Bid Opening in the Auditorium of the School Board Administration Building at 2:00 p.m., August 3, 1999.

Mrs. Barbara McCants, Acting Chairperson
Mr. Lalo Arrien, Procurement and Materials Management
Ms. Marilyn Hernandez, Bureau of Facilities Management

CONSTRUCTIN BIDS

Project No. A-0544
ADDITION/REMODELING & RENOVATION
NORLAND ELEMENTARY SCHOOL

<u>BIDDER</u>	<u>BOND/CHECK</u>	<u>DEDUCTIVE ALTERNATE #1</u>	<u>BASE BID</u>
ACT SERVICES, INC. Miami, FL Addenda #1 Y TSA Y	5%	(15,000)	1,340,000
MEXAL CORP. Miami, FL Addenda #1 Y TSA Y	5%	(22,800)	1,390,000
J.P. MORAN Miami, FL Addenda #1 Y TSA Y	5%	(20,500)	1,528,400

CONSTRUCTION BIDS

OFFICIAL RESULTS OF AUGUST 3, 1999 BID OPENING

Project No. JOC 99 - CENTRAL /

BIDDER	BOND AMOUNT	APPENDIX	NSF	DESIGN OVERLAP	DESIGN OVERLAP	DESIGN OVERLAP	DESIGN OVERLAP	DESIGN OVERLAP
F & L CONSTRUCTION	5 PERCENT	N/A	Y	1.0499	1.0699	0.9521	1.1099	0.9903
REGOSA ENGINEERING	\$20,000.00	A	Y	1.0000	1.1500	0.9800	1.1000	0.9995
TRAN CONSTRUCTION	\$20,000.00	A	Y	0.9629	1.0000	0.9539	1.0000	0.9608

PURCHASING BIDS

BID #194-XX10 -- IRRIGATION SYSTEM REPAIR SERVICE CONTRACT

A & B Irrigation Design
Evergreen Sprinkler Systems, Inc.
Hector Turf (no bid) (submitted 1 no bid) (1 letter/no bid)
Irritech International, Inc. (letter/no bid)
Prestige Foods, Inc. (letter/no bid)
Quality Grassing & Services, Inc.
Newco Irrigation, Inc. (no bid)
Reliable Sprinkler (submitted 2 no/bids)
Sav-On Utility Supplies (letter/no bid)

BID #245-XX10 -- TOOLBOX (WITH TOOLS)

Hughes Tool Supply (letter/no bid)
Johnstone Supply of Hialeah
Miami Industrial Services, Inc.
W. W. Grainger

BID #280-XX02 -- POWER TOOLS

Boltek International, Inc. (no bid)
Electro Power Utility Sales Co.
Hemet Valley Tool
Home Depot
I M A Tool Distr-Mia, Inc.
Lankford Equipment Co., Inc
Mark Well of Fla (submitted 2 bids)
MCR Lumber & Materials Supply, Inc.
Miami Discount Tool & Hardware
Miami industrial Services, Inc.
Pan American Tool Corp. (letter/no bid)
Ronnie's Hardware, Inc.
Satco Supply
W. W. Grainger, Inc.

PURCHASING BIDS

BID #287-XX02 -- WASTE REMOVAL HAZARDOUS/NON-HAZARDOUS INDUSTRIAL

Adviron Environment System
Cliff Berry, Inc.
E. M. C. Oil Corp.
Magnum Environmental Services, Inc.
Miami Industrial Services, Inc. (letter/no bid)
Perma-Fix of Florida, Inc.
Petroleum Management, Inc.
USL City Environmental Services of Florida, Inc.
Utility Resources of America (letter/no bid)
Waste Management of Dade County (letter/no bid)

BID #291-XX02 -- SOD, FURNISH AND INSTALL NORTH OF FLAGLER

Arbor Tree & Landscape Co., Inc. (letter/no bid)
Ernest Morrison (letter/no bid)
IGWT Construction
Landscape Service Professional (letter/no bid)
Manuel Diaz Farms (no bid)
Melrose Nursery, Inc.
Reed Landscaping, Inc. (letter/no bid)
Rouco & Son, Inc.
Sunset Sod, Inc.
Thomas Maintenance Service
Utility Resources of America (letter/no bid)
3H Management Corporation