THE SCHOOL BOARD OF MIAMI-DADE COUNTY
Regular Bid Opening

The following persons were present at the Bid Opening in the Auditorium of the School
Board Administration Building at 2:00 p.m., June 8, 1999,

Mr. Robert F. Steel, Jr., Acting Chairperson

Mr. Amos Roundtree, Procurement and Materials Management

Ms. Marilyn Hernandez, Bureau of Fagilities Management

CONSTRUCTION BIDS

Project No. A-06396

Primary Leamning Center (PLC ‘A1)
JORN I. SMITH ELEMENTARY SCHOOL

BIDDER BOND/CHECK

Building Design International
Miami, FL

Addendum #1-3 Y
TSAY

Mexal Carp,

Miami, FL
Addendum#1-3 Y
TSAY

Di Pompeo Construction Corp.

Miami, FL
Addendum #1-3 Y
TSAY

James P. Moran Inc.
Miami, FL
Addendum #1-3 Y
TSAY

Crisal Construction Co,
Miami, FL

Addendum #1-3 Y
TSAY
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BASE BID
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1,775,000

1,787,000

1,814,230
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CONSTRUCTION BIDS

Project No. A-0696

Primary Learning Center (PLC ‘A-1")

JOHN . SMITH ELEMENTARY SCHOOL

BIDDER BOND/CHECK  ALTERNATE #1 BASE BID
Grace & Naeem Uddin Inc. NONE 1,860,000
Miami, FL
Addendum #1-3 Y
TSAY :
Vasallo Construction Inc. NONE 2,024,777
Miami, FL
Addendum #1-3
TSAY
JOC99-AG
BIDDER BOND/CHECK  ADDENDA 184 OEM 1 ITEM2 (TEM 3 [EM4 COMBO
MAC CONSTRUCTION, INC. 5.00% A&B Y 1.0500 1.1500 1.1000 1.1500 1.0925
YRV CONSTRUCTION CORP. $20.000.00 A&B Y 1.0600 1.0800 1.04Q0 1.0700 1.0485
G.C.CM,INC. $20,000.00 A&B Y 1.1400 1.1200 1.1200 1.1000 1.1240
MEXAL CORPORATION $20.000.00 A&B Y 1.1388 11189 1.1188 1.0989 1.1225%
EBRACE & NAEEM UDDIN, INC. $20,000.00 A&B Y 0.9000 1.1000 2.9800 0.9500 0.9645;
Note: low bidder is indicated by bardered data
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CONSTRUCTION BIDS

JOC99-AH

BIQDER BONDIGHECK

MAC CONSTRUCTION, INC. 5.00%
VRV CONSTRUCTION CORP. $20,000.00

G.C.CM., INC. $20,000.00

ADDENDA

A&B

A&B

ALB

1.0500

1.0700

1.1200

1.1500

1.0800

1.1200

1.1000

1.0600

1.1200

1.1500
1.0800

1.1000

TEM 1 ITEM 2 [EM 3 [TEM4  comao

1.092:

1.065¢

1.115¢

{MEXAL CORPORATION $20,000.00

A&B

1.0488

1.1488

1.0000

1.0988

GRACE & NAEEM UDDIN, INC. $20,000.00

Note: low bidder is indicated by bordered data

PURCHASING BIDS

A&B

BID #242-XX05 -- ELECTRICAL RACEWAYS AND FITTINGS

Emsco, Inc. (no bid)
ESI International, inc. (no bid)
ESS International (no bid)

Fife Florida Electric Supply, Inc. (no bid)

Gator Dist.

General Electric Supply Co.
Mercedes Electric Supply Co.
Miami Electric Supply (letter/no bid)
Miami Industrial Services, Inc.

Ray's Electrical Supplies, Inc. (letter/no bid)

Rexell Consolidated Electric Supply
Richard Electric Supply Co., Inc.
Royal Electrical Supply, Inc.

South Dade Electrical Supply (letter/no bid)

Tropic Electric, Inc. (letter/no bid)
World Electronic, Inc.

Bid Opening Minutes

Page 3 of 5

1.00C0

1.1000

1.0300

1.1000

June 8, 1999

1.024z

1.02¢5



PURCHASING BIDS

BID #246-XX10 -- PROVIDE HYPERTENSION SCREENING FOR GRADE TEN

STUDENTS

Compass Health System PA (letter/no bid}
Cross Country Staffing (letter/no bid)

Easter Seal Soc-Dade County (letter/no bid)
Family Life Center (letter/no bid)

Genia Randall (letter/no bid)

Health Testing Centers (letter/no bid)
Jewish Family Service of Greater Miami (letter/no bid)
Nursefinders, Inc.

Port of Miami Medical Clinic (letter/no bid)
Preventive Medicine Testing Ctr., Inc.

U/M Behavioral Medicine Resource Program

BID #260 -XX02 -- FIRE EXTINGUISHERS

A-Advanced Fire & Safety Equip.

All Specialty Sales, inc. (no bid)

AMJ Eguipment Corporation (letter/no bid)
Atlantic Fire Equipment Co., Inc.

Atlantic Mills Co.

Biko

Biscayne-Havana Fire & Safety

Biitz' Enterprises (letter/no bid)

County Fire Equipment Co.

Firemaster/Master Protection Corp./Miami District
G. L. Distributors, Inc.

Marc

Merrick International

Miami Fire Equipment (letter/no bid/1 bid enveiope)
Millennium Fire & Safety Equip

N. N. International

R. A. M. Industrial Distributors, Inc. (letter/no bid)
S & H Distributors, Inc.

Triangle Fire, Inc.
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PURCHASING BIDS

BID #261-XX07 - DIESEL FUEL LOW SULFUR

Blayock Oil Co.

BP Oil Company (no bid)

BV Oil Company

Coastal Refining & Marketing
Consolidated Oil Company
Flamingo Oil Company (letter/no bid)
Hess Oil & Chemical Corp. (no bid)
MacMillan Oit Co. of Florida
Mansfield Oil Company

Osher Oil Corporation (d/b/a Costa Oil Company)
Petroleum Traders Corp.

Phoenix Petroleum

Prestige Foods, Inc. (letter/no bid)

R. S. Hughes Co., Inc. (letter/no bid)
Tropic Oil Company (letter/no bid)

BID #269-XX10 --PROVIDE STATE REQUIRED SCOLIOSIS SCREENING FOR GRADE
e e e R U o I DUREENING FOR GRADE

SEVEN STUDENTS

Compass Health System PA (letter/no bid)
Cross Country Staffing (letter/no bid)

Easter Seal Soc-Dade County

Genia Randall (letter/no bid)

Health Testing Center (letter/no bid)

Jewish Family Service of Greater Miami (letter/no bid)
Miami Behavioral Health Center (letter/no bid)
Nursefinders, Inc.

Port of Miami Medical Clinic (letter/no bid)
Preventive Medicine Testing Ctr., Inc. (no bid)
Specialized Nursing Services, Inc. (letter/no bid)
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